
       
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY, KANSAS 

 
  
Amended Agenda 
 
WEDNESDAY, APRIL 27, 2011   
-4:00 p.m.   
-Convene 
-Consider approval of a proclamation to declare April 28, 2011 as “Worker’s Memorial Day.” –backup to follow 
 
CONSENT AGENDA 

(1) (a)  Consider approval of Commission Orders; and 
(b) Consider approval of the low bid from Cargill Salt for the supply of 2,000 tons of highway de-icing 

salt at a total cost of $99,960.00 (Keith Browning) 
 

REGULAR AGENDA        
(2) Review and approve the Douglas County Community Corrections Comprehensive Plan Grant 

Application for 2012  & Review and Approve the Community Corrections Budget Summary and 
Narrative for 2012 (Ron Stegall) 
 

(3) Consider extending health insurance plan coverage to domestic partners and dependent children of the 
domestic partner. (Sarah Plinsky) 

 
(4) Executive Session for the purpose of consultation to discuss possible acquisition of property.    
 
(5) Other Business 

(a) Consider approval of Accounts Payable (if necessary) 
(b) Appointments:     

Lawrence-Douglas County Metropolitan Planning Commission 05/31/11;  
Property Crimes Compensation Board 04/30/11 

(b) Miscellaneous 
(c) Public Comment 

 
(6) Adjourn  

 
WEDNESDAY, MAY 4, 2011    
4:00 p.m. Only 
-Discuss and consider approval of Employee Insurance Plan Renewal (Sarah Plinsky) 
-Presentation by Natural and Cultural Heritage Task Force on Heritage Conservation Bylaws and grant 
program (Ken Grotewiel/Collin Bielser) 
-Adopt resolution to give notice of a public hearing for Yankee Tank Dam ???? 
 
WEDNESDAY, MAY 11,  2011   
NE Sector Plan 
 
WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2011 
  
WEDNESDAY, MAY 25, 2011 – Light Agenda 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 1, 2011 
 
 WEDNESDAY, JUNE 8, 2011 
 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 15, 2011 
 



WEDNESDAY, JUNE 22, 2011 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 29, 2011 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Note: The Douglas County Commission meets regularly on Wednesdays at 4:00 P.M. for administrative items and 6:35 
P.M. for public items at the Douglas County Courthouse. Specific regular meeting dates that are not listed above have not 
been cancelled unless specifically noted on this schedule.  



 
 
 
 
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 

To : Board of County Commissioners 
 
From : Keith A. Browning, P.E., Director of Public Works/County Engineer 
 
Date : April 19, 2011 
 
Re : Consent Agenda Acceptance of Low Bid for Supply of Highway De-Icing Salt 
 
Bids were opened April 18, 2011 for the supply of highway de-icing salt for the 2011-
2012 snow and ice season.  The City of Lawrence, City of Eudora, City of Baldwin, 
Wakarusa Township, City of Ottawa, and Franklin County all participated with the 
County in the request for bids.  The City of Lawrence requested bids for 3,500 tons of 
salt, City of Eudora requested bids for 200 tons of salt, Wakarusa Township requested 
bids for 400 tons, City of Baldwin requested 500 tons, Franklin County requested bids 
for 1,800 tons, the City of Ottawa requested bids for 300 tons and Douglas County 
requested bids for 2,000 tons.  Bids for Douglas County are as follows. 
 
Vendor  Quantity (tons) Unit Cost  Total Cost 
 
Cargill Salt   2,000  $49.98  $  99,960.00 
Independent Salt  2,000  $54.43  $108,860.00 
Hutchinson Salt  2,000  $62.50  $125,000.00 
Dale Brothers  2,000  $62.50  $125,000.00 
North American Salt  2,000  $94.71  $189,420.00  
  
Under terms of the contract, 500 tons would be delivered prior to October 2011 and 
remaining 1,500 tons would be delivered after January 1, 2012.  The Road & Bridge 
Fund has $56,123 remaining in the Salt line item for FY 2011.  We do not anticipate 
overspending our funds for salt this year due to revenues received from outside 
agencies. 
 
Action Required: Consent Agenda approval of the low bid from Central Salt for the 
supply of 2,000 tons of highway de-icing salt at a total cost of $99,960.00. 



BID TAB FOR HIGHWAY SALT Bid No. 11-F-0013 - Bid Opening Date April 18, 2011

Douglas County City of Lawrence City of Eudora City of Baldwin Wakarusa Twp. Franklin County City of Ottawa
VENDOR

Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton

GRASS PAD 2000 No Bid 3500 No Bid 200  No Bid 500  No Bid 400  No Bid 1800  No Bid 300  No Bid

MORTON SALT 2000 No Bid 3500 No Bid 200 No Bid 500 No Bid 400 No Bid 1800 No Bid 300 No Bid

DALE BROTHERS 2000 $62.50 $125,000.00 3500 $62.50 $218,750.00 200 $62.50 $12,500.00 500 $62.50 $31,250.00 400 $62.50 $25,000.00 1800 $62.50 $112,500.00 300 $62.50 $18,750.00

NORTH AMER. 2000 $94.71 $189,420.00 3500 $94.71 $331,485.00 200 $94.12 $18,824.00 500 $95.72 $47,860.00 400 $99.22 $39,688.00 1800 $95.04 $171,072.00 300 $95.04 $28,512.00

HUTCHINSON 2000 $62.50 $125,000.00 3500 $62.50 $218,750.00 200 $62.50 $12,500.00 500 $63.13 $31,565.00 400 $62.50 $25,000.00 1800 $62.50 $112,500.00 300 $62.50 $18,750.00

INDEPENDENT 2000 $54.43 $108,860.00 3500 $54.43 $190,505.00 200 $54.43 $10,886.00 500 $54.93 $27,465.00 400 $54.93 $21,972.00 1800 $55.43 $99,774.00 300 $55.43 $16,629.00INDEPENDENT 2000 $54.43 $108,860.00 3500 $54.43 $190,505.00 200 $54.43 $10,886.00 500 $54.93 $27,465.00 400 $54.93 $21,972.00 1800 $55.43 $99,774.00 300 $55.43 $16,629.00

CARGILL SALT 2000 $49.98 $99,960.00 3500 $49.98 $174,930.00 200 $49.98 $9,996.00 500 $49.98 $24,990.00 400 $49.98 $19,992.00 1800 $49.98 $89,964.00 300 $49.98 $14,994.00

2000 3500 200 500 400 1800 300

2000 3500 200 500 400 1800 300

2000 3500 200 500 400 1800 300

2000 3500 200 500 400 1800 300

2000 3500 200 500 400 1800 300

Director of Public Works:  Keith A. Browning County Clerk:  Jamie Shew Dated: 04/18/2011 
By:  Rita Fulks 





















































































































MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:    The Board of County Commissioners 
 
FROM:    Sarah Plinsky, Assistant County Administrator 
 
CC:    Craig Weinaug, County Administrator 
 
SUBJECT:  Consider extending health insurance benefits to domestic partners of employees  
 
DATE:    April 27, 2011 
 
Commissioner Gaughan asked staff to explore the possibility of providing health insurance coverage to 
domestic partners of employees.  There a number of factors to explore in making this decision.   
 
Financial Issues 

This change has financial impacts for both the employee and the organization.  Concerning the 
organization, for each employee that is added to our plan the county incurs a subsidy cost as outlined 
below.  For purposes of this analysis, I assumed that most employees with eligible dependent children 
interested in coverage are already on the plan.  If the children are already covered under “Employee 
plus family,” adding a domestic partner to the plan does not call for any additional costs for the 
employee or the organization.  Therefore, the most relevant subsidy for this analysis is employees 
moving from “Employee Only” coverage to “Employee plus one” coverage.   For each employee that 
moves from “Employee Only” coverage to “Employee plus one” coverage, the County incurs a subsidy of 
$4,380 annually.   

Current Health Insurance rates (through June 1st) 

   County cost per 
month 

Employee 
contribution per 
month 

Difference 

Plan 1: Employee only  $543.00  $29.00  $514.00  

Plan 2: Employee plus 
one 

$1,062.00  $183.00  $879.00  

Plan 3: Employee plus 
family 

$1,518.00 $254.00 $1,264.00 

       

Difference between Plan 1 and Plan 2 subsidies:  $365.00  

Difference between Plan 1 and Plan 3 subsidies:  $750.00 



Difference between Plan 1 and Plan 2 subsidies annualized:  $4,380.00  

Difference between Plan 1 and Plan 3 subsidies annualized:  $9,000.00 

It is difficult to estimate the number of employees that would come on to the plan or switch coverage 
because of this coverage change.  U.S.D. 497 extends health insurance plan coverage to domestic 
partners.  U.S.D. 497 has 1800 employees, with 1,450 employees participating in their health insurance 
plan.  While they don’t track the number of employees utilizing the domestic partner health insurance 
closely, they estimate they currently have six or less active domestic partners.  The County extends 
health insurance coverage to employees of Bert Nash Mental Health Center, Lawrence Douglas County 
Health Department, Extension Council, and Townships and we have approximately 704 employees 
eligible for coverage, with 618 employees with active health insurance plan coverage.  Given the size of 
our organization, I would conservatively estimate five to ten employees would utilize this coverage.  
Please note that this estimate is purely an educated guess.  Given the personal nature of the subject, it is 
inappropriate for staff to survey employees to get a better understanding of how many employees may 
choose to utilize this coverage.   

As outlined above, with an estimate of five to ten employees electing to change coverage from 
“Employee only” to “Employee plus one,” the cost to the health insurance plan (at current rates) is 
estimated to be $21,900 to $43,800.  That cost increases $23,693.60 to $47,387.20 when employer 
taxes are added to the cost estimate, as outlined later in this analysis.  However, it important to note 
that because the County is self‐insured, the plan would be responsible for any and all actual medical 
claims for an individual on the plan, up to $150,000, when stop loss coverage activates.    

In addition to the cost to the plan, the organization could incur additional costs on taxable wages.  This 
cost impacts both the employee and the organization.  Concerning the employee, married employees do 
not pay taxes on healthcare benefits that they receive for their spouses and dependents because federal 
tax laws do not classify the employer’s financial support of the coverage for these benefits as wages.  
Employees with a domestic partner receiving health coverage do not necessarily receive that same 
favorable tax benefit.   Rather, the employee must pay taxes on the employer’s share of payment for the 
benefits of domestic partners, unless the domestic partner qualifies as a “dependent” under federal tax 
law.    

Because a domestic partner is not considered a spouse under federal tax law, the tax treatment of the 
domestic partner depends on whether the domestic partner qualifies as the employee's “dependent.”  
Several criteria must be met for a domestic partner to be considered a dependent (Internal Revenue 
Code IRC §152), as follows: 

• The domestic partner may not have income more than the exemption amount ($3,700 
in 2011)annually. 

• The employee must provide more than 50% of the domestic partner’s support for the 
year.  Support includes food, shelter, clothing, medical and dental care, education and 
the like. 

• Employee must maintain and occupy the household the entire calendar year.  



• The domestic partner cannot file a joint return for the year.  )However, if the only 
reason a joint return is filed is to get a refund and no return is otherwise required, this 
test is satisfied.) 

• The domestic partner must be a U.S. citizen or resident, but residents of Canada and 
Mexico can also qualify. 

• The domestic partner cannot be a dependent of any other taxpayer. 
• An additional requirement imposed by Code § 152(f)(3) provided that an individual is 

not considered a member of a taxpayer’s household if the relationship in violation of 
local law. 

If the employee does qualify as a dependent, then payments for healthcare coverage and other benefits 
is treated in the same way as coverage for other employees with family coverage.  The County doesn’t 
have to become intimately entwined with determining satisfaction of the required criteria and is 
permitted to rely upon an employee’s certification that the employee’s domestic partner is a dependent 
or upon a copy of the employee’s prior years income tax return that shows the domestic partner as a 
dependent. 

If the domestic partner does not qualify as a dependent, the value of the coverage is included in the 
gross income of the employee, and the value of the coverage must be reflected on the employee'sW‐2 
Form.  Employers are responsible for identifying a “fair market value” of the benefit.  For guidance on 
how to identify the fair market value, I utilized “The Employer’s Handbook: Complying with IRS Benefit 
News” newsletter recommendations and have identified the fair market value as the difference in 
County subsidy for “Employee Only” coverage and the County subsidy for “Employee plus one” 
coverage.  As outlined in the table below, the fair market value of the subsidy would be $365.00 a 
month or $4,380.00 a year.   

Current Health Insurance rates (through June 1st) 

   County cost per 
month 

Employee 
contribution per 
month 

Difference 

Plan 1: Employee only  $543.00  $29.00  $514.00  

Plan 2: Employee plus 
one 

$1,062.00  $183.00  $879.00  

       

Difference between Plan 1 and Plan 2 subsidies:  $365.00  

Difference between Plan 1 and Plan 2 subsidies annualized:  $4,380.00  

This amount would need to be added to employee W‐2’s and subjected to Social Security, FICA, FUTA, 
and federal withholding taxes.  The tax impact of that additional benefit to the employee is difficult to 
estimate because it varies by individual employee salary amounts, other income, deductions, and tax 
withholdings. 



 Concerning the financial impact to the County, as the employer, we would have to pay additional FICA 
and unemployment on that increased benefit.   As outlined above, for each $4,380.00 added to an 
employee’s wages, the County would be responsible for an additional $335.07 in FICA and $23.65 in 
unemployment tax, for a total of $358.72 in employer taxes.        
 
Other Issues 
 
Legal Issues 
In 2006, the Kansas Constitution was amended to define marriage under the Defense of Marriage Act 
(DOMA).  While not specifically addressed in statute or in any reported cases or Attorney General 
opinions, it does not appear that a public agency extending health insurance benefits to domestic 
partners of employees is a violation of this constitution amendment.  However, because the issue is not 
specifically addressed in the DOMA , if the County were to proceed with this change, we might be 
subject to a legal challenge.  The prospects of a successful challenge, however, are significantly reduced 
if the County does not require members of a domestic partnership to be of the same sex. 
 
Defining the domestic partnership is usually done with an affidavit.  Many organizations use the 
following criteria to define the partnership. 
 

• Both persons are at least 18 years of age 

• Both persons have a common residence, and share living expenses 

• Both persons are in a committed, exclusive relationship in existence for longer than six 
months  

• Neither person is married to someone else or is a member of another domestic 
partnership 

• Both persons are not related by blood in any way that would prevent them from being 
married to each other in this State 

• Both persons are capable of consenting to the domestic partnership 
 
With the advice of legal counsel, staff would prepare affidavits to be signed and notarized by both 
domestic partners.  As outlined above, the County would include information on the affidavit to 
document whether or not the domestic partner could be considered a dependent for tax purposes.  The 
County would also need to determine if any dependent children of the domestic partner would be 
eligible for coverage as well.  If the Commission decides to extend coverage to domestic partners, staff 
recommends extending coverage to dependent children of a domestic partner to ensure consistency.  If 
the domestic partner is not considered a dependent, there would be an additional tax impact to the 
organization and the employee for that coverage.     
 
Administrative staff would maintain these affidavits.  A similar affidavit would be needed to dissolve the 
domestic partnership, so that coverage could be discontinued.  Administrative Services would need to 



be informed within 60 days of a change of relationship, similar to other “life event” changes, to change 
health coverage.   
 
Other Benefit Issues: 
In the research that I have done on this issue, it is often advised that domestic partnership rights be 
extended to opposite sex partners that meet the definitions outlined on the affidavit to avoid any 
discrimination and be consistent in how the relationship is treated.  I would recommend that we treat all 
domestic partnerships the same.   
 
Under DOMA, domestic partners are not entitled to federal COBRA coverage.  The County may 
voluntarily extend continuation coverage to domestic partners when an employee separates from the 
organization.  However, the issue will have to be discussed with insurance carriers as to whether they 
will provide continuing coverage, even though not required.  In addition, the County provides health 
coverage to retirees and their spouses.  An employer has the option to extend retire health coverage to 
domestic partners, so we need to decide if the County wants to extend that coverage.  In addition, 
certain spousal benefits, such as survivor and pre‐retirement annuities under pension plans and the 
right to death benefits under 457 plans, will not be afforded to these couples pursuant to Defense of 
Marriage Act (DOMA). 
 
Unless the domestic partner qualifies as the employee’s dependent under Code section 152, the cost of 
domestic partner health coverage may not be paid on a pre‐tax basis or by using flexible spending 
credits. Likewise, a domestic partner who is not a Code section 152 dependent may not receive benefits 
under a flexible spending account i.e. Cafeteria Plan.  An employee may make mid‐year election changes 
to his cafeteria plan election due to a change in domestic partnership only if the partner is a Code 
section 152 dependent. 

Currently, County Personnel Policies do not allow employees to use sick, funeral, and Family Medical 
Leave Act leave for domestic partners and relatives of domestic partners, in same way as spouses are 
treated.  If the Commission decides to proceed with including domestic partners in the health insurance 
plan, these leave policies should be updated as well.     
 
Action Steps: 

• Determine if the County wants to extended health insurance plan coverage to domestic 
partners and dependent children of the domestic partner.   

• Determine if other benefits (COBRA, leave, retiree health benefits) should be extended 
to domestic partners as well.   
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