
   
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY, KANSAS 

 
 
Amended Agenda 05/29/12 
 
WEDNESDAY, MAY 30, 2012  
4:00 p.m.  
-Convene 
-Consider approval of a proclamation declaring the week of June 3-9, 2012 as “Relay for Life Week” 
(Betty Parks) 
-Consider approval of the minutes for April 25, May 9 and May 16, 2012 
 
CONSENT AGENDA 

(1) (a) Consider approval of Commission Orders;  
(b)  approval of the low bid from Cargill Salt for the supply of 1,500 tons of highway de-icing salt at 

a total cost of $74,970.00.(Keith Browning);   
(c)  Authorization for the Public Works Director to act as Douglas County’s authorized 

representative in submitting an application for federal assistance for the purchase cost of a 3-
sided precast concrete culvert to replace Structure No. 05.54N-17.50E (Keith Browning);   

 
REGULAR AGENDA   

(2) Discuss possible treatment of Eurasian Watermilfoil at Lone Star Lake (Keith Browning) 
 

(3)  Consider revised Project Agreement for Corridor Management funding for US-56 reconstruction 
from Bullpup Drive west through E 1600 Road intersection near Baldwin City; Project No. 56-23 
KA-2294-01 (Keith Browning) 

(4) Consider participating with City of Eudora on improvements to N 1300 Road (Keith Browning) 
 

(5) Other Business  
 (a) Consider approval of Accounts Payable (if necessary) 
 (b) Appointments:  

-Heritage Conservation Council (2) Positions – 05/12 
-Douglas County Representative to the Johnson County Sunflower Community  
Redevelopment Authority 10/12 

(c) Public Comment  
(d) Miscellaneous 
 

RECESS 
 

RECONVENE 
6:35 p.m. 

 
(6) Public Hearing on the application for a Temporary Business Permit for the 156th Anniversary of 

John Brown’s battle at Black Jack Battlefield and Nature Park calendar events scheduled for June 
2, 2012. (Linda Finger) 

 
(7)  Adjourn 

 
TUESDAY, JUNE 5, 2012 
4:30 P.M. – Joint Study Session with City Commission discussing the Retiree Attraction Task Force held at 
City Hall 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 6, 2012 
-Consider approval of Service Agreement between Douglas County, Kansas and Cannon Cochran 
Management Services, Inc. to serve as Third Party Administrator of Douglas County’s Workers’ Compensation 



Self-Insurance Program. (Sarah Plinsky)  
 
-Executive Session for the purpose of consultation with County Counselor on matters, which would be 
deemed, privileged under the attorney-client relationship. The justification is to maintain attorney client 
privilege on a matter involving Douglas County. 
 
 
 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 13,  2012 
4:00 p.m. 
-Establish Date for Public Hearing for Yankee Tank improvement district 
 
6:35 p.m. 
-Discussion on Resolution implementing open burning regulations for the unincorporated areas of Douglas 
County  
 
-Consider revisions to the Inverness Park District Plan, CPA-2-1-12. Initiated by City Commission on 1/17/12. 
Adopt on first reading, Joint City Ordinance No. 8732 and County Resolution for Comprehensive Plan 
Amendment (CPA-2-1-12) to amend Horizon 2020, Chapter 14, Inverness Park District Plan. Dan Warner will 
present the item. 
 
-Reconsider Comprehensive Plan Amendment, CPA-6-5-09, to Horizon 2020 – Chapter 14 to include the 
Northeast Sector Plan. Approved by Planning Commission 5-4 on 9/20/10. Referred to Planning Commission 
by the Board of County Commission and City Commission for consideration of specific issues. Approved by 
Planning Commission 7-2 on 4/23/12. Dan Warner will present the item. 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 20, 2012 
6:00 p.m. 
-Presentation from Fair Grounds CIP Committee 
 
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 27, 2012 
4:00 p.m. 
-Conduct Public Hearing to consider adoption of Assessment Resolution 
 
WEDNESDAY, JULY 4, 2012 - Cancelled 
 
WEDNESDAY, JULY 11, 2012 4:00 p.m. – Cancelled; 6:35 p.m. – Tentatively Cancelled 
 
 
 
Note: The Douglas County Commission meets regularly on Wednesdays at 4:00 P.M. for administrative items and 6:35 
P.M. for public items at the Douglas County Courthouse. Specific regular meeting dates that are not listed above have not 
been cancelled unless specifically noted on this schedule.  



 
 
 

 
Office of the County Commission 

PROCLAMATION 
For Douglas County, Kansas 

 
WHEREAS, The American Cancer Society Relay For Life is a life-changing event that gives everyone in more 
than 5,000 communities across the globe a chance to celebrate the lives of people who have battled cancer, 
remember loved ones lost, and fight against the disease; and  

WHEREAS, money raised during the Relay For Life of Douglas County, Kansas helps support research, 
education, advocacy, and patient services; and 

WHEREAS, Relay For Life helps fund more than $100 million in cancer research each year; and 

WHEREAS, cancer survivors are honored with a victory lap as they lead the way around the track, followed by 
teams who keep a representative walking on the track from 7:00 p.m. until 7:00 a.m. because cancer never 
sleeps; and 

WHEREAS, survivors and those remembered are represented by thousands of luminaria which line the running 
track, their candles glowing from dusk throughout the night; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY, KANSAS, do hereby 
proclaim June 3rd through June 9th, 2012 as, 

“RELAY FOR LIFE WEEK” 
 

 

in Douglas County and encourage citizens to participate in the American Cancer Society Relay For Life of 
Douglas County to be held at Free State High School Track, 4800 Overland Drive in Lawrence beginning at 5:00 
p.m. on Friday, June 8th and ending at 7:00 a.m. on Saturday, June 9th. 
 
ADOPTED this 30th day of May, 2012. 
       BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
       OF DOUGLAS COUNTY, KANSAS 
  
       ___________________________________ 
       Mike Gaughan, Chairman 
 
 
       ___________________________________ 
       Nancy Thellman, Vice-Chair 
 
 
       ___________________________________ 
       Jim Flory, Member 



 
 
 
 
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 

To : Board of County Commissioners 
 
From : Keith A. Browning, P.E., Director of Public Works/County Engineer 
 
Date : May 23, 2012 
 
Re : Consent Agenda Acceptance of Low Bid for Supply of Highway De-Icing Salt 
 
Bids were opened May 21, 2012 for the supply of highway de-icing salt for the 2012-
2013 snow and ice season.  The City of Lawrence, Wakarusa Township, and the City of 
Ottawa all participated with Douglas County in the request for bids.  The City of 
Lawrence requested bids for 2,500 tons of salt, Wakarusa Township requested bids for 
300 tons, and the City of Ottawa requested bids for 250 tons and Douglas County 
requested bids for 1,500 tons.  Bids for Douglas County are as follows. 
 
Vendor  Quantity (tons) Unit Cost  Total Cost 
 
Cargill Salt   1,500  $49.98  $   74,970.00 
Central Salt   1,500  $50.59  $   75,885.00 
Independent Salt  1,500  $52.98  $   79,470.00 
Hutchinson Salt  1,500  $61.42  $   92,130.00 
North American Salt  1,500  $89.62  $ 134,430.00 
Morton Salt   1,500  No Bid  $    0.00  
  
Action Required: Consent Agenda approval of the low bid from Cargill Salt for the 
supply of 1,500 tons of highway de-icing salt at a total cost of $74,970.00. 



BID TAB FOR HIGHWAY SALT Bid No. 12-F-0016 - Bid Opening Date: 3:00 PM, Monday, May 21, 2012

Douglas County City of Lawrence Wakarusa Twp. City of Ottawa
VENDOR

Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton Qty $/Ton

Independent Salt Co. 1500 $52.98 $79,470.00 2500 $52.98 $132,450.00 300 $52.98 $15,894.00 250 $52.98 $13,245.00

Central Salt LLC (Lyons) 1500 $50.59 $75,885.00 2500 $50.59 $126,475.00 300 $50.59 $15,177.00 250 $50.59 $12,647.50

North American Salt Co. 1500 $89.62 $134,430.00 2500 $89.62 $224,050.00 300 $89.62 $26,886.00 250 $89.62 $22,405.00

Hutchinson Salt Co. 1500 $61.42 $92,130.00 2500 $62.60 $156,500.00 300 $62.00 $18,600.00 250 $56.73 $14,182.50

Cargill, Inc. 1500 $49.98 $74,970.00 2500 $49.98 $124,950.00 300 $49.98 $14,994.00 250 $49.98 $12,495.00

Morton Salt 1500 No Bid 2500 No Bid 300 No Bid 250 No Bid

1500 2500 300 250

1500 2500 300 250

1500 2500 300 250

1500 2500 300 250

1500 2500 300 250

1500 2500 300 250

Director of Public Works:  Keith A. Browning County Clerk:  Jamie Shew 
By:  Rita Fulks By:  Benjamin Lampe













































 
 
 
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 

To     : Board of County Commissioners 
 
From : Keith A. Browning, P.E., Director of Public Works/County Engineer 
 
Date  : May 24, 2012 
 
Re     :  Consent Agenda authorization to sign application for federal funding assistance 
  US Fish & Wildlife Service funding for purchase of 3-sided concrete culvert 
  Replacement of Bridge No. 05.54N-17.50E 
 
Terese Gorman, Engineering Division Manager, has been working with the US Fish & 
Wildlife Service on possible federal funding for the purchase of a precast concrete 3-
sided culvert.  The USFWS is very interested in the 3-sided culverts we have installed 
and their benefits to aquatic stream life.  Several locations have been discussed in the 
past, but federal funding opportunities did not materialize prior to our replacing the 
structures. 
 
The referenced location is on E 1750 Road approximately 0.54 miles north of N 500 
Road.  The existing structure is a 12’ span x 12’ high reinforced concrete box (RCB).  
There is significant downstream erosion.  The channel flowline elevation immediately 
downstream is several feet lower than the flowline elevation of the RCB.  This elevation 
difference hinders movement of aquatic life, thus making it an attractive candidate for 
this federal funding.  Replacement of this structure is currently not in the CIP.  It is 
currently not scheduled in our culvert replacement list, but is shown to be considered for 
future replacement.  
 
The application for federal funding requires signature by an “authorized representative”.   
The regulations require we have on file a copy of the governing body’s authorization to 
sign the application as an authorized representative. 
 
Action Required: Consent Agenda authorization for the Public Works Director to act as 
Douglas County’s authorized representative in submitting an application for federal 
assistance for the purchase cost of a 3-sided precast concrete culvert to replace 
Structure No. 05.54N-17.50E. 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 

To     : Board of County Commissioners 
 
From : Keith A. Browning, P.E., Director of Public Works/County Engineer 
 
Date  : May 23, 2012 
 
Re     :  Discuss possible treatment of Eurasian Watermilfoil at Lone Star Lake 
 
You will recall last fall we discussed the concern of Eurasian watermilfoil (EWM) 
infesting Lone Star Lake.  This plant is an exotic plant that can quickly become a 
nuisance.  Richard Sanders, KDWP fisheries biologist, notified us last year he saw 
Eurasian watermilfoil (EWM) growing in Lone Star Lake.  We surveyed the lake last 
year with Richard, and found EWM in several areas of the lake.  Following is information 
from Richard Sanders provided last year: 

Unlike curlyleaf pondweed, EWM does not die off early in the summer, rather it 
continues to grow throughout the growing season.  EWM is a submersed plant 
rooted to the bottom and growing up to the surface.  It commonly occupies water 
down to 15 feet deep, but has been reported down to 30 feet in very clear 
water.  A dense canopy often forms at the suface of the water, which interferes 
with recreational uses of water such as boating, fishing, and swimming.  
Excessive growth of the species may alter aquatic ecosystems by decreasing 
native plant and animal diversity and abundance and by affecting the 
predator/prey relationships of fish.  A healthy lake is damaged because heavy 
infestations of EWM lower dissolved oxygen under the canopy, increase daily 
pH shifts, reduce water movement and wave action, increase sedimentation 
rates and reduce turbidity.  I recommend treating it now with a herbicide to try to 
eradicate it before it proliferates.   

 
Richard recommended treating EWM with an herbicide, but last fall we felt it was too 
late for treatments.  We now feel that treating the EWM with herbicide is necessary. 
 
Richard Sanders will attend the BOCC meeting to participate in the discussion. 
 
Action Required: Discuss the growth of Eurasian watermilfoil in Lone Star Lake, and 
provide direction on treatment as appropriate. 





















 
 
 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 

To     : Board of County Commissioners 
 
From : Keith A. Browning, P.E., Director of Public Works/County Engineer 
 
Date  : May 23, 2012 
 
Re     :  Consider participating with City of Eudora on improvements to N 1300 Road 
 
The City of Eudora has requested Douglas County participation in surface 
improvements on N 1300 Road (20th Street in Eudora) between E 2100 Road 
(Winchester Road) and Route 1061 (Church Street).  The surface improvements would 
also include the short section of E 2100 Road from N 1300 Road to the K-10 overpass 
(approximately 830 linear feet).  N 1300 Road is situated along the southern city limits, 
with properties on the north in the City of Eudora and properties on the south mostly in 
the unincorporated area.  E 2100 Road is situated along the western city limits with 
properties on the west side in the unincorporated area.  Improvements would include 
adding rock base material and double chip sealing the rock base. 
 
This road has been problematic for years with Eudora Township maintaining the rock 
portion of the road and the City maintaining the chip sealed portion closer to Route 
1061.  It’s typically in poor condition, and we receive lots of complaints.     
 
The City of Eudora is willing to do the work, but requests we pay for a contractor to Bo-
Mag the road (i.e. use a reclaimer piece of equipment to thoroughly mix the base 
material), haul additional rock base (haul costs only), and grade and shape the rock 
base.  They estimate this contract cost to be $40,064 (see attached spreadsheet).  The 
$67,070 shown in the spreadsheet as Eudora costs represents material costs only.  
They would perform the work using their own personnel. 
 
I would recommend we participate by paying 100% of any contract costs, up to a 
maximum $45,000, and pay for it from CIP (using “Road CIP Contingency” funds).  This 
seems a small price to pay to get the township out from under this problematic road, 
and to provide better service to the public.  The City of Eudora will maintain the road 
following this work. 
 
Action Required: Authorize participation with City of Eudora in surfacing improvements 
on N 1300 Road (20th Street) from E 2100 Road (Winchester Road) to Route 1061 
(Church Street), and on E 2100 Road (Winchester Road) from N 1300 Road (28th 
Street) to the K-10 overpass.  Douglas County participation is limited to paying 100% of 
any required contract costs up to a maximum $45,000, and is conditioned upon the City 
of Eudora assuming full maintenance of both roadway sections. 
 
 



Proposed 
Material Quantity unit Price Range Cost Party

AB-3 3,300 tons 6 $19,800 City of Eudora
Chips 280 tons 10 $2,800 City of Eudora
Prime (MC-30) 3100 gallons 3.7 $11,470 City of Eudora
Seal (MC-3000) 10000 gallons 3.3 $33,000 City of Eudora

Sub- Total $67,070
Material Quantity unit Price Range Cost

Bo-Meg 12473 sq. yards 1.25 $15,591 Do. County / Township
Grade & Roll 12473 sq. yards 1 $12,473 Do. County / Township
Gravel Hauling $12,000 Do. County / Township

Sub-Total $40,064
Total $107,134

20th street chip & seal, cost estimates



DOUGLAS COUNTY ZONING & CODES DEPARTMENT 
 

 Linda M. Finger  
Interim Director 

 
 

NOTICE  
 

HEARING DATE CORRECTION 
 
 
TO: Property owners within 1,000 feet and property owners within 1 mile of the 

main entrance to Black Jack Battlefield & Nature Park, 615 E 1452 Road, 
Baldwin City, Kansas 

 
FROM : Linda Finger, Interim Director, Douglas County Zoning & Codes Dept. 
 
DATE : May 25, 2012 
 
RE : Temporary Business Permit – Black Jack Battlefield and Nature 

 Park - Calendar of Events 2012 
 
 
The Black Jack Battlefield Trust, Inc. is planning an event for 2012 for the 156th 
Anniversary of John Brown’s Battle at Black Jack, Dawn of the Civil War for the 
following date: 
 
June 2, Saturday  

• Dawn at Black Jack Battlefield – 5:00 A.M.  (Free) 
• John Brown Returns – 1:00 P.M.  (Free) 
• Nature Park Tour   (Free) 
• 1856 Lamplight Camp Tour - 8:00 P.M.  (Cost  12 and up $8.00) 

 
Black Jack Battlefield Park, 163 E 2000 Road, Baldwin City, Kansas, will have guided 
tours, live period music, and a traveling historical exhibit on display on June 2, 2012.   
 
The Douglas County Commission hearing on this application will be Wednesday, MAY 
30, 2012, 6:35 P.M., Douglas County Courthouse, 2nd floor, 1100 Massachusetts Street, 
Lawrence, Kansas. 
 
Should you have any questions on this matter prior to the hearing, please contact the 
Douglas County Zoning & Codes Department at (785) 331-3143. 
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